
City of Sedro-Woolley
AMENDED - FINAL BID SUMMARY
HAMMER HERITAGE SQUARE WOOD STAINING AND SEALING PROJECT
BID OPENING:  FEBRUARY 24, 2011, 2:00 PM

RANK COMPANY NAME TOTAL BID AMOUNT MRSC

Non-responsive Kaplan Homes Unlimited LLC, Sedro-Woolley, WA 2,047.54$                                 Yes

2 Park Place Painting, Battle Ground, WA 3,562.40$                                 Yes

3 Rick Tesarik's Painting Co., Sedro-Woolley, WA 3,989.33$                                 Yes

4 Welch Meeds Construction Inc., Enumclaw, WA 4,046.68$                                 Yes

5 Henifin Construction LLC, Bellingham, WA 4,133.24$                                 Yes

6 Tumi Construction LLC, Federal Way, WA 4,582.70$                                 Yes

7 Champion Landscaper.com LLC, Kent, WA 4,598.50$                                 Yes

8 Onedurr Painting, Lakewood, WA 4,741.32$                                 Yes

9 Saxon Painting LLC, Tacoma, WA 4,823.56$                                 Yes

10 NI Painting and Construction Co., Bellevue, WA 4,941.49$                                 Yes

11 Sound Home Construction, Mount Vernon, WA 5,769.22$                                 Yes

12 Allied Contracting Services, Stanwood, WA 6,437.90$                                 No

13 Stensrud Construction Services LLC, Kirkland, WA 7,465.80$                                 Yes

14 Home & Garden Bldrs., Everson, WA 9,710.95$                                 No

15 Upland Developers Inc., Ferndale, WA 9,935.13$                                 Yes

16 Profection Painting Inc., Maple Falls, WA 12,000.00$                               No

No Bid Sabelhaus West Inc., Silverdale, WA No Bid Yes

No Bid Profile Construction Inc., Bellingham, WA No Bid Yes
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