

City of Sedro-Woolley																													
Wheeled Carts, BID																													
Bid Tabulation - FINAL																													
Bid Date: January 6, 2015, 2:00 PM																													
By: Leo Jacobs		ESTIMATE				Toter Inc. North Carolina				Stellar Manufacturing Bend, OR				IPL Inc. Quebec, Canada				Rehrig Pacific Company Los Angeles, California				OTTO Enviromental North Carolina				Cascade Engineering Inc. Grand Rapids, MI			
Type	Quantity				Base Unit Price	Quantity Discount	Price Per Unit with Qty Discount	Total	Base Unit Price	Quantity Discount	Price Per Unit with Qty Discount	Total	Base Unit Price	Quantity Discount	Price Per Unit with Qty Discount	Total	Base Unit Price	Quantity Discount	Price Per Unit with Qty Discount	Total	Base Unit Price	Quantity Discount	Price Per Unit with Qty Discount	Total	Base Unit Price	Quantity Discount	Price Per Unit with Qty Discount	Total	
Wheeled Carts Plastic																													
20 gallon <i>inserts</i>	75				25.03	75.00	25.03	\$ 1,877.25	No Bid		0.00	\$ -	37.00	1.00	37.00	\$ 2,775.00	96.08	75	24.63	\$ 1,847.25	32.00	0.00	32.00	\$ 2,400.00	28.00		28.00	\$ 2,100.00	
35 gallon	150				41.28	75.00	41.28	\$ 6,192.00	No Bid		0.00	\$ -	44.61	1.00	44.61	\$ 6,691.50	96.08	150	51.37	\$ 7,705.50	46.52	\$8.66/150	37.86	\$ 5,679.00	66.75	375.00	43.75	\$ 6,562.50	
45 gallon	75				45.28	75.00	45.28	\$ 3,396.00	No Bid		0.00	\$ -	No bid		No bid	\$ -					50.50	\$6.42/150	50.50	\$ 3,787.50	94.00	375.00	71.00	\$ 5,325.00	
68 gallon	75				47.28	75.00	47.28	\$ 3,546.00	No Bid		0.00	\$ -	60.11	1.00	60.11	\$ 4,508.25	104.99	75	59.67	\$ 4,475.25	54.61	\$6.39/198	54.61	\$ 4,095.75	75.00	375.00	51.00	\$ 3,825.00	
95 gallon	75				53.28	75.00	53.28	\$ 3,996.00	No Bid		0.00	\$ -	64.51	1.00	64.51	\$ 4,838.25	111.45	75	65.35	\$ 4,901.25	58.51	\$3.92/198	58.51	\$ 4,388.25	81.00	375.00	58.00	\$ 4,350.00	
195 gallon	20				No Bid		No Bid	\$ -	383.07	20.00	383.07	\$ 7,661.40	No bid		No bid	\$ -	No Bid				No bid			\$ -					
SUBTOTAL								\$ 19,007.25				\$ 7,661.40				\$ 18,813.00				\$ 18,929.25				\$ 20,350.50				\$ 22,162.50	
WSST AT 8.5%								\$ 1,615.62				inc				\$ 1,599.11					\$ 1,608.99				\$ 1,729.79				\$ 1,883.81
TOTAL								\$ 20,622.87				\$ 7,661.40				\$ 20,412.11				\$ 20,538.24				\$ 22,080.29				\$ 24,046.31	
ALTERNATE																													
95 gallon	4,000					4000 or min trkload	\$ 50.71	\$ 202,840.00			No bid	\$ -	62.34	400	62.34	\$ 249,360.00	\$ 111.45	4,000	\$ 62.66	\$ 250,640.00	\$ 51.29	4,000	51.29	\$ 205,160.00	\$ 49.58	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 49.58	\$ 198,320.00	
NOTES:																													
Subtotal 20-95 Gal							complete	\$ 19,007.25			No bid	\$ -			partial	\$ 18,813.00			partial	\$ 18,929.25			complete	\$ 20,350.50			complete	\$ 22,162.50	
Subtotal 195 Gal							no bid	\$ -			bid	\$ 7,661.40			no bid	\$ -			no bid	\$ -			no bid	\$ -			no bid	\$ -	
Total																													