


| | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
|---|---------------------------|-----------------|--|--|--|--|---|--|--------------------|---|---|--|--------------------|--|---|--|--------------|
| City of Sedro-Woolley | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Wheeled Carts, BID | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Bid Tabulation - FINAL | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Bid Date: March 10, 2016, 2:00 PM | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
|  | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| By: Leo Jacobs | | ESTIMATE | | | | Toter LLC (Primary Bid) Statesville, NC | | | | Rehrig Pacific Company Los Angeles, CA | | | | OTTO Enviromental Charlotte, NC | | | |
| Type | Estimated Quantity | | | | | Base Unit Price (minimum 1 each) | Quantity Discount if applicable (state minimum required) | Price Per Unit (with quantity discount) | Total | Base Unit Price (minimum 1 each) | Quantity Discount if applicable (state minimum required) | Price Per Unit (with quantity discount) | Total | Base Unit Price (minimum 1 each) | Quantity Discount if applicable (state minimum required) | Price Per Unit (with quantity discount) | Total |
| Wheeled Carts Plastic | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 20 gallon <i>Inserts</i> | 75 | | | | | 25.22 | 75 | 25.22 | \$ 1,891.50 | 100.00 | 75 | 28.00 | \$ 2,100.00 | No bid | | | No bid |
| 32 gallon | 150 | | | | | 41.61 | 75 | 41.61 | \$ 6,241.50 | 150.00 | 150 | 45.08 | \$ 6,762.00 | No bid | | | No bid |
| 45 gallon | 75 | | | | | 45.61 | 75 | 45.61 | \$ 3,420.75 | No bid | | No bid | - | No bid | | | No bid |
| 68 gallon | 75 | | | | | 47.01 | 75 | 47.01 | \$ 3,525.75 | 104.00 | 75 | 53.99 | \$ 4,049.25 | No bid | | | No bid |
| 95 gallon | 450 | | | | | 51.36 | 450 | 51.36 | \$23,112.00 | 111.00 | 450 | 58.85 | \$26,482.50 | No bid | | | No bid |
| 195 gallon | 10 | | | | | No Bid | | No Bid | \$ - | No bid | | No bid | - | No bid | | | No bid |
| SUBTOTAL | | | | | | | | | \$38,191.50 | | | | \$39,393.75 | | | | \$ - |
| WSST AT 8.5% | | | | | | | | | \$ 3,246.28 | | | | \$ 3,348.47 | | | | \$ - |
| TOTAL | | | | | | | | | \$41,437.78 | | | | \$42,742.22 | | | | \$ - |
| NOTES: | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| Subtotal 20, 32, 68 and 95 Gal | | | | | | | | | \$34,770.75 | | | | \$39,393.75 | | | | No Bid |
| Subtotal 45 Gal | | | | | | | | | \$ 3,420.75 | | | | No Bid | | | | No Bid |
| Subtotal 195 Gal | | | | | | | | | No Bid | | | | No Bid | | | | No Bid |