

<b>City of Sedro-Woolley</b>													
<b>Commercial Front Load Dumpsters</b>													
<b>Bid Tabulation - FINAL</b>													
<b>Bid Date: January 6, 2015, 2:00 PM</b>													
		<b>Rehrig Pacific Company</b>				<b>OTTO Enviromental</b>				<b>Toter Inc.</b>			
<b>By: Leo Jacobs</b>		<b>Los Angeles, California</b>				<b>North Carolina</b>				<b>North Carolina</b>			
<b>ESTIMATE</b>													
<b>Type</b>	<b>Quantity</b>	<b>Base Unit Price</b>	<b>Quantity Discount</b>	<b>Price Per Unit with Qty Discount</b>	<b>Total</b>	<b>Base Unit Price</b>	<b>Quantity Discount</b>	<b>Price Per Unit with Qty Discount</b>	<b>Total</b>	<b>Base Unit Price</b>	<b>Quantity Discount</b>	<b>Price Per Unit with Qty Discount</b>	<b>Total</b>
<b>BASE BID, PLASTIC</b>													
2 Yard Dumpster - Plastic	30	922.25	30.00	613.00	\$ 18,390.00	529.00		529.00	\$ 15,870.00	649.48		649.48	\$ 19,484.40
3 Yard Dumpster - Plastic	6	1014.50	6.00	716.10	\$ 4,296.60	910.00		910.00	\$ 5,460.00	729.48		729.48	\$ 4,376.88
4 Yard Dumpster - Plastic	6	1139.00	6.00	803.00	\$ 4,818.00	985.00		985.00	\$ 5,910.00	889.48		889.48	\$ 5,336.88
6 Yard Dumpster - Plastic	2	4079.00	2.00	2317.00	\$ 4,634.00	1170.00		1170.00	\$ 2,340.00	No Bid		No Bid	-
8 Yard Dumpster - Plastic	2	4188.00	2.00	2425.00	\$ 4,850.00	1300.00		1300.00	\$ 2,600.00	No Bid		No Bid	-
<b>SUBTOTAL</b>					\$ 36,988.60				\$ 32,180.00				\$ 29,198.16
<b>WSST AT 8.5%</b>					\$ 3,144.03				\$ 2,735.30				\$ 2,481.84
<b>TOTAL</b>					\$ 40,132.63				\$ 34,915.30				\$ 31,680.00

