



CITY OF SEDRO-WOOLLEY
 2018 Sedro-Woolley FS1 Metal Roof and Siding Project
BID TABULATION - FINAL
 Small Works Roster Phone and Email Solicitation Closed: 10/26/2018

Prepared by: J. Rosario, Public Works Assistant *JR*

Contractor Name:				J.M. Construction and Drywall Sedro-Woolley, WA		Esary Roofing and Siding Co. Inc. Burlington, WA		Scholten Roofing Inc. Lynden, WA		Axis Roof and Gutter Inc. Arlington, WA		Hytech Roofing Inc. Lynden, WA		Rainshield Roofing & Construction Inc. Ferndale, WA		Skagit Roofing Inc. Bow, WA	
ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY	UNIT	UNIT	TOTAL	UNIT	TOTAL	UNIT	TOTAL	UNIT	TOTAL	UNIT	TOTAL	UNIT	TOTAL	UNIT	TOTAL
1	FS 1 Metal Roof and Siding Project	1.00	LS	13,500.00	13,500.00	30,075.00	30,075.00	69,612.62	69,612.62	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	SUBTOTAL				13,500.00		30,075.00		69,612.62								
	WASHINGTON STATE SALES TAX AT 8.5%				1,147.50		2,556.38		5,917.07								
	TOTAL				14,647.50		32,631.38		75,529.69								

Corrections made to calculations
 MRSC
 Position:

Yes 1 Yes 2 Yes 3 Yes 4 Yes 5 Yes 6 Yes 7